
TODAY 
  
There is more to the announcements than what you hear. Follow us on Twitter @cary_chatter 
and get all the news in advance.  
  
Varsity Boys Soccer came from behind to win 4-0 vs. Riverside. Bilal Natchet and Carlos Perez 
scored for the Imps. 
  
JV Soccer won 2-1 against Durham Riverside on the strength of 2 goals by Emerson Ayala 
Recino. 
  
Key Club is sponsoring a service project to help raise money for Nolan Turner using Key Club 
and COTA (Children's Organ Transplant Association). 
  
Nolan Turner, a Junior, was born with spina bifida (spine-ah  biff-a-dah) and one of the 
complications is kidney failure. Nolan has begun dialysis (die-al-e-sis) 3 times a week, for 4 
hours each time, and is on the kidney transplant list. Through October 13th, “Nickels for Nolan” 
donation boxes will be in classes and, in addition, there will be a table set up at homecoming 
accepting donations, along with information on Nolan and becoming an organ donor. Thank you 
for supporting one of our own! Let’s show Nolan what Imps can do for their fellow Imps!   
  
All FBLA members and potential members walking in the homecoming parade should attend a 
meeting in room 2210, today, during A Lunch. 
  
History Movies Club will meet, today,  during lunch in Room 410 to finish the movie about 
World War 2. 
  
University of North Carolina at Chapel Hill will be in the gym lobby, today, during lunch to 
answer any questions you may have.  
  
The Cary High Muslim Student Association will meet today, in Mr. Ashburn's Room, 2130.  All 
are invited, snacks will be provided. 
  
TOMORROW 
  
UNC Air Force ROTC will be in the 11 Building Lobby, tomorrow, from  12:00 - 12:50 to 
answer any questions you may have. 
  
Seniors: If you would like to be considered for a FULL scholarship to North Carolina Central 
University or North Carolina A&T State University, sign up in Student Services by tomorrow. 
  
Alpha Beta is an honor society for underclassman. Applications for current sophomores are 
available in room 1112 and are due tomorrow. 
  
Key Club is holding a drive to collect items for the Wake County Animal Shelter.  Please bring 
items like wet food and blankets to 2107 by tomorrow. 



  
There will be a mandatory meeting for any girl interested in trying out for GYMNASTICS on 
Monday, during A lunch in room 3140. 
  
  
ON HOLD 
  
Prospective SkillsUSA members: Your $20 national and state membership dues need to be paid 
to Mr. Kimberley, in 2111, by next week.  
  
Tickets are now on sale for THE CRUCIBLE, October 17th-21st at 7pm. Seats are limited so get 
your seat now! www.caryhsperformingarts.com 
  
Seniors and teachers, it’s not too early to take those Senior Selfies and get them in for the senior 
video.  Send to seniorselfies2018@gmail.com.  
  
Have you gotten your crucible tickets yet? October 17th-21st at 7pm. 
www.caryhsperformingarts.com 
  
Attention Seniors: Sign up in Student Services by October 13th, if you want to be nominated for 
the N. C. State University College of Textiles Centennial Scholarship. 
  
Anyone interested in SWIMMING or DIVING this winter- there is a mandatory meeting about 
tryouts on TUES. OCT. 10 during lunch in Rm 2206 
  
Want to learn IMPROV? Want to try out for IMPROV? Come to drama room at lunch on Thurs., 
oct 12th to learn how to IMPROV! 
  
Thur., Oct. 12 Meredith College during lunch  gym lobby 
  
The Marine Corp. recruiter will be in the gym lobby during lunch on Thur., Oct. 12. to answer 
your questions about joining. 
  
A representative from William Peace Univ. will be in the gym lobby during lunch on Thur., Oct. 
12. to answer your questions. 
  
Interested in attending East Carolina Univ.? The ECU rep will be in the gym lobby during lunch 
on Fri., Oct. 13 to answer questions. 
  
Mon., Oct. 16 Wake Technical Community College 11:00 - 1:00 Student Services BOP room 
  
Wed., Oct. 18 Appalachian State University during lunch in the gym lobby 
  
Friday, Oct. 27 - PACE University - gym lobby - 12:00 - 12:50 
  
Mon., Oct. 30 High Point University 12:07 - 12:57 gym lobby 



  
Wed., Nov. 1 UNC at Greensboro 12:07-12:57 in the gym lobby 
  
Wed., Nov. 1 University of Alabama 12:07-12:57 in the gym lobby 
  
Wed., Nov. 8 UNC at Charlotte 12:07-12:57 in the gym lobby 
  
The Gradúate (Grad - you - ah- tay) Program will meet every Monday and Wednesday in the 
Media Center at 2:30pm. 
  
Ambassadors are supporting Wands for Wildlife.  Gather your old mascara wands and ring them 
to 2134. We will send them to the Appalachian Wildlife Refuge to be used to help heal and care 
for injured and orphaned wildlife.  Go to appalachianwild.org for more information.  
	


